2/15/2012

DATE: BID DATE 2/10/12

CHEMICAL BIDS

ITEM NO PART NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNITS HURON LIME LOW BID TOTAL EPCO LOW BID TOTAL GREER LIME LOW BID TOTAL POLYDYNE LOW BID TOTAL % LOW BID TOTAL USALCO LOW BID TOTAL
1 LB-2-007 Sulfuric Acid 800,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
2 LB-2-001 SOd'“m(ng’sc)’Ch'O”te 10,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

0

3 LB-2-011 Liquid Caustic (50%) 20 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
LB-2-009 Soda Ash 7,200 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
5 LB-2-003 Sodium Bisulfite 4,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

WD-2-1065, Liquid Chlorine in One . . . . . .
6 WW-3-100 Ton Cylinders 30,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
6 (a) N/A Cylinder Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7 ww-0-2061 | Hauid Cchﬁ::gee:” 150# 6,500 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7(a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 ww-z-101  |-aud S“g‘;;f%'g’r"dewo # 5,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 (a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

WW-3-104, - . . . . . .
9 WD-2-1015 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 162 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 354.3800 57409.56
10 WD-2-1000 High %ﬂﬂﬁﬁ?n ZEbb'e 650 tons 151.0000 0 no bid 0 178.5000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
11 WD-2-1030 Sodium Silicofluoride 7,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
12 WD-2-1040 Sodium 9,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 1.0700 9630.00 no bid 0
Hexametaphosphate

13 LB-2-024 Microbiocide 1,100 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
14 LB-2-027 35% Hydrazine 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
15 LB-2-023 Flocculant 3,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
16 WD-2-1070 Carbon Dioxide(Liquid) 110,000 Ibs. no bid 0 0.0520 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
17 LB-2-012 Liquid Caustic (20%) 20 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

100% Tetrasodium . . . . . .
18 LB-2-029 EDTA/NTA Blend 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
19 LB-2-006 HEDP Formulation 12,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
20 wD-2-1005 | Sedium Tolytriazole 55 1 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

gallon drum

Phosphate Dispersant . . . . . .

21 LB-2-004 20,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
Polymer 55 gallon drum
22 LB-2-031 Benzotriazole 22,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
23 WW-3-106 Liquid Sodium Aluminate 75 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 1,289.4700 0
0 0 0 0 0 no bid 0
TOTAL $ $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00 $9,630.00 $57,409.56
TOTAL OF ALL BID AWARDS $518,095.61




2/15/2012 DATE: BID DATE 2/10/12
ITEM NO PART NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNITS JCI JONES LOW BID TOTAL | NEO SOLUTIONS | LOW BID TOTAL | SAL CHEMICAL | LOWBID TOTAL TIDEWATER LOW BID TOTAL |MISSISSIPPI LIME| LOW BID TOTAL | CARMEUSE LIME| LOW BID TOTAL
1 LB-2-007 Sulfuric Acid 800,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 0.10280 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
2 LB-2-001 SOd'“m(ng’sc)’Ch'O”te 10,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0 0.91500 9150.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
0

3 LB-2-011 Liquid Caustic (50%) 20 dry tons 589.0000 11780.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
LB-2-009 Soda Ash 7,200 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 0.22700 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
5 LB-2-003 Sodium Bisulfite 4,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0 1.77000 7080.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

WD-2-1065, Liquid Chlorine in One . . . . .
6 WW-3-100 Ton Cylinders 30,000 Ibs. 0.2750 8250.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
6 (a) N/A Cylinder Deposit 1 ea. 750.0000 750.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7 ww-0-2061 | Hauid Cchﬁ::gee:” 150# 6,500 Ibs. 0.4000 2600.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7(a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. 100.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 ww-z-101  |-aud S“g‘;lrir'ij'gr"dewo # 5,000 Ibs. 0.7300 3650.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 (a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. 100.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
9 WW-3-104, 1| iquid Aluminum Sulfate 162 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 502.70000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

WD-2-1015
10 WD-2-1000 High %ﬂﬂﬁﬁ?n ZEbb'e 650 tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 140.7500 91487.50 175.2000 0
11 WD-2-1030 Sodium Silicofluoride 7,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 0.45400 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
12 WD-2-1040 Sodium 9,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 1.32800 0 no bid 0 no bid 0.00 no bid 0
Hexametaphosphate

13 LB-2-024 Microbiocide 1,100 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
14 LB-2-027 35% Hydrazine 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
15 LB-2-023 Flocculant 3,000 Ibs. no bid 0 1.2000 3600.00 no bid 0 1.3500 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
16 WD-2-1070 Carbon Dioxide(Liquid) 110,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
17 LB-2-012 Liquid Caustic (20%) 20 dry tons 799.0000 15980.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

100% Tetrasodium . . . . . .
18 LB-2-029 EDTA/NTA Blend 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
19 LB-2-006 HEDP Formulation 12,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid no bid 0 no bid 0
20 wD-2-1005 | Sedium Tolytriazole 55 1 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0

gallon drum

Phosphate Dispersant . . . . . .

21 LB-2-004 20,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
Polymer 55 gallon drum
22 LB-2-031 Benzotriazole 22,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
23 WW-3-106 Liquid Sodium Aluminate 75 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
0 0 0 0 0 0
TOTAL $ $43,010.00 $3,600.00 $16,230.00 $0.00 $91,487.50 $0.00
TOTAL OF ALL BID AWARDS $518,095.61




2/15/2012 DATE: BID DATE 2/10/12
CONTINETAL APPLIED
ITEM NO PART NO DESCRIPTION UANTITY UNITS BONDED LOW BID TOTAL UNIVAR USA LOW BID TOTAL —CARBONIC LOW BID TOTAL KA STEEL LOW BID TOTAL AIRGAS LOW BID TOTAL SP_ECIALTIES LOW BID TOTAL
1 LB-2-007 Sulfuric Acid 800,000 Ibs. 0.1019 0 0.0998 79840.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
2 LB-2-001 S°d'“m(1Hg’£‘)’°h'°”te 10,000 gal. 0.9700 0 15100 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
0
3 LB-2-011 Liquid Caustic (50%) 20 dry tons 599.0000 0 688.0000 0 no bid 0 634.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
LB-2-009 Soda Ash 7,200 Ibs. 0.2140 1540.80 0.3150 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
5 LB-2-003 Sodium Bisulfite 4,000 gal. 1.8200 0 2.7000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
WD-2-1065, Liquid Chlorine in One . . . . . .
6 WW-3-100 Ton Cylinders 30,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
6 (a) N/A Cylinder Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7 ww-0-2061 | Hauid Cchﬁ::r;ee:” 150# 6,500 Ibs. 0.5200 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
7(a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. 100.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 ww-z-101  |-aud S“g‘;lr"?d'g’r"dewo # 5,000 Ibs. 0.8200 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
8 (a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. 100.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
WW-3-104, - . . . . . . .
9 WD-2-1015 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 162 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
10 WD-2-1000 High Calcium Pebble 650 tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
Quicklime
11 WD-2-1030 Sodium Silicofluoride 7,000 Ibs. 0.4190 2933.00 0.5650 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
12 WD-2-1040 Sodium 9,000 Ibs. 1.1000 0 1.8700 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
Hexametaphosphate
13 LB-2-024 Microbiocide 1,100 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
14 LB-2-027 35% Hydrazine 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
15 LB-2-023 Flocculant 3,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
16 WD-2-1070 Carbon Dioxide(Liquid) 110,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 0.0525 0 no bid 0 0.0470 5170.00 no bid 0
17 LB-2-012 Liquid Caustic (20%) 20 dry tons 890.0000 0 810.0000 0 no bid 0 803.0000 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
100% Tetrasodium . . . . . .
18 LB-2-029 EDTA/NTA Blend 2,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0.00 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
19 LB-2-006 HEDP Formulation 12,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
20 wD-2-1005 | Sedium Tolytriazole 55 1 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0
gallon drum
Phosphate Dispersant . . . . .
21 LB-2-004 20,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 1.5600 31200.00
Polymer 55 gallon drum
22 LB-2-031 Benzotriazole 22,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 2.5050 55110.00
23 WW-3-106 Liquid Sodium Aluminate 75 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 no bid 0 1,210.5300 90789.75
0 0 0 0 0 0
TOTAL $ $4,473.80 $79,840.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,170.00 $177,099.75
TOTAL OF ALL BID AWARDS $518,095.61




2/15/2012 DATE: BID DATE 2/10/12
ITEM NO PART NO DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNITS QUES IND LOW BID TOTAL _ LOW BID TOTAL
1 LB-2-007 Sulfuric Acid 800,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
2 LB-2-001 Sodium Hypochlorite 10,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0
(15%)
3 LB-2-011 Liquid Caustic (50%) 20 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0
LB-2-009 Soda Ash 7,200 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
5 LB-2-003 Sodium Bisulfite 4,000 gal. no bid 0 no bid 0
WD-2-1065, Liquid Chlorine in One . )
6 WW-3-100 Ton Cylinders 30,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
6 (a) N/A Cylinder Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0
7 Ww-0-2061 | Liauid Chiorine in 150 % 6,500 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
Cylinder
7(a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0
8 ww-3-101  |Hiauid Sulfur Dioxide150 # 5,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
Cylinder
8 (a) N/A Deposit 1 ea. no bid 0 no bid 0
WW-3-104, - . . .
9 WD-2-1015 Liquid Aluminum Sulfate 162 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0
10 WD-2-1000 High Calcium Pebble 650 tons no bid 0 no bid 0
Quicklime
11 WD-2-1030 Sodium Silicofluoride 7,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
12 WD-2-1040 Sodium 9,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
Hexametaphosphate
13 LB-2-024 Microbiocide 1,100 Ibs. 2.9500 3245.00 no bid 0
14 LB-2-027 35% Hydrazine 2,000 Ibs. 3.4000 6800.00 no bid 0
15 LB-2-023 Flocculant 3,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
16 WD-2-1070 Carbon Dioxide(Liquid) 110,000 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
17 LB-2-012 Liquid Caustic (20%) 20 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0
100% Tetrasodium .
18 LB-2-029 EDTA/NTA Blend 2,000 Ibs. 2.5500 5100.00 no bid 0
19 LB-2-006 HEDP Formulation 12,000 Ibs. 1.2500 15000.00 no bid 0
20 wD-2-1005 | Sedium Tolytriazole 55 1 Ibs. no bid 0 no bid 0
gallon drum
21 LB-2-004 Phosphate Dispersant 20,000 Ibs. 1.9500 0 no bid 0
Polymer 55 gallon drum
22 LB-2-031 Benzotriazole 22,000 Ibs. 2.9000 0 no bid 0
23 WW-3-106 Liquid Sodium Aluminate 75 dry tons no bid 0 no bid 0
0 0
TOTAL $ $30,145.00 $0.00
TOTAL OF ALL BID AWARDS $518,095.61




